



Republic of the Philippines
PROVINCE OF BENGUET
 La Trinidad
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
 (Drugs and Medicines / Medical Supplies)

ACTION SLIP

DATE: MARCH 23, 2022
SUBJECT: _____

PR NO. 2022-02-0481

BAC ACTION:

recommend award to:
 • Northeast Medical trading - items no. 2, 3, 4, 5, 7, 8, 9 and 10
 • Xamax General Enterprise - items no. 1 and 6

return to end-user all items _____
 items nos. _____

reason / s: _____

over and above ABC
 counter offer / s
 others _____

for another SVP / shopping with philGEPS posting _____
 for TWG action / verification / evaluation _____
 for referral to _____

<i>Absent</i> P NORA M. RUIZ, MD Member	 FIDELA A. LUIS Member	 ANTONIO B. AMLAG Member
<i>Absent</i> TOMASA S. ATAYOC Member	 WILMA L. LEE, MD Member	<i>Absent</i> MELIARAZON F. DULAY, MD Vice Chairperson
	 ATTY. BRIAN J. CRISPIN Chairperson	
Observer		End User Representative Provisional Representative



PROVINCE OF BENGUET
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE (BAAC)
(DRUGS AND MEDICINES / MEDICAL SUPPLIES)
ABSTRACT OF PRICE QUOTATIONS - NEGOTIATED PROCUREMENT
(SMALL VALUE PROCUREMENT)



[Signature]
[Signature]
[Signature]

P.R. No.: 2022-02-0481 Quotation No.: SVP - 2022-0044 Dated: February 28, 2022 Opened on: March 9, 2022 Abstract No.: 0057

Item No.	Code	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	DESCRIPTION/SPECIFICATION OF ARTICLES	Brand/ Offer		Price		Brand/ Offer		Price		Unit	ABC	Total
1		10	box	Bulb, X-ray polinator, halogen Display/Optic lamp, 64640 HLX, 150watts, 24 volts, G6.25, NAEDD 54263	NO POST PART	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	434.5	434.5	434.5		
2		5	roll	Thermal print paper for ultrasound, Type V, High glossy, 110mm x 18m	SONY	920.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	1,100.00	1100	5500			
3		5	bot	Ultrasound transmission gel, Water soluble, 250ml	SONAR (TBM)	62.00	NO BID	NO BID	82.50	82.5	412.5				
4		3	box	Ultrasound Probe cover, Hygienic Protection cover, Length 190mm, Width 51 2mm, Probe cover is straight walled with smooth surface, round-ended	ORMED	764.00	NO BID	NO BID	1430.00	1430	4290				
5		8	set	X-ray Developing and Fixing solution set, Automatic processor, 5 liters/gallon (Must be the same brand)	Fuji	2,899.00	NO BID	NO BID	6,600.00	6600	52800				
6		2	box	X-ray Film 8 x 10, Green Sensitive, 100's	Fuji	2,178.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,773.20	1773.2	354.00				
7		3	box	X-ray Film 10 x 12, Green Sensitive, 100's	Fuji	2,389.00	NO BID	NO BID	2,574.00	2574	7722				
8		3	box	X-ray Film 11 x 14, Green Sensitive, 100's	Fuji	2,565.00	NO BID	NO BID	3,212.00	3212	9636				
9		5	box	X-ray Film 14 x 14, Green Sensitive, 100's	Fuji	3,096.00	NO BID	NO BID	4,268.00	4268	21340				
10		6	box	X-ray Film 14 x 17, Green Sensitive, 100's	Fuji	4,608.00	NO BID	NO BID	4,928.00	4928	29568				

Northern Benguet District Hospital

Purpose: 139,159.90



**PROVINCE OF BENGUET
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE (BACH)
(DRUGS AND MEDICINES / MEDICAL SUPPLIES)
(SMALL VALUE PROCUREMENT)**



ABSTRACT OF PRICE QUOTATIONS - NEGOTIATED PROCUREMENT

P.R. No.: **2022-02-0481** Quotation No.: **SVP - 2022-0044** Dated: **February 28, 2022** Opened on: **March 9, 2022** Abstract No.:

Opening/ Abstracting: _____ BAC Action/ Recommendation: _____

VERA DE ORTIZ
BAC-TWG Member

DANELA S. BARRA
BAC-Secretariat Member

<i>FULLY FORWARDED</i>	<i>EVASION</i>

End-user Representative

NORA M. RUIZ
NORA M. RUIZ, MD
Member

FIDELA A. LUIS
FIDELA A. LUIS
Member

ANTONIO B. AMIAG
ANTONIO B. AMIAG
Member

TOMASAS ATAYOC
TOMASAS ATAYOC
Member

WILMALUBOS-LE
WILMALUBOS-LE
Member

MELIA RAZON E. DELAY
MELIA RAZON E. DELAY, MD.
Vice Chairperson

ATTY. BRIAN J. CRISPIN
ATTY. BRIAN J. CRISPIN
Chairperson