



PROVINCE OF BENGUET
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE (BeCt)
(DRUGS AND MEDICINES / MEDICAL SUPPLIES)



ABSTRACT OF PRICE QUOTATIONS - NEGOTIATED PROCUREMENT
(SMALL VALUE PROCUREMENT)

P.R. No.: **2022-01-0001**

Quotation No.: **SVP-2022-0046**

Dated: **March 3, 2022**

Opened on: **MARCH 9, 2022**

Abstract No.:

Item No.	Code	QTY	UNIT	DESCRIPTION/SPECIFICATION OF ARTICLES	MECANORTH PHARMA		BLESSED ST. JOHN PHARMACEUTICALS & GEN. MDSE		MALUKA INTERNATIONAL TRADING CORP.		REM CITIMED PHARMA DIST		ABC	
					Brand/Offer	Price	Brand/Offer	Price	Brand/Offer	Price	Brand/Offer	Price	Unit	Total
13		25	amp	Amiodarone HCl 50mg/ml, 3mL (150mg/3mL) (IV)	NO BID				NO BID				440.00	11,000.00
14		30	amp	Amino Acids, Crystalline Standard, Inj. 9.12%, 20mL	KANTORIN	700.00							270.00	8,100.00
19		1,400	amp	Anti-Tetanus Serum Equine (ATS) 1500 IU	ATS HARVAL	17000				120.00			70.00	98,000.00
20		160	amp	Atropine Sulfate 1mg/mL, 1ml, Inj.	NO BID								12.00	1,920.00
22		500	amp	Bupivacaine HCl, Heavy, 0.5% X 4mL (spinal); hyperbaric, polyampule, in clear sterile single package with 8% dextrose	NO BID				NO BID			NO BID	120.00	60,000.00
24		10	amp	Carboprost 250mcg/ml	NO BID								480.00	4,800.00
27		400	amp	Clindamycin Phosphate 150mg/mL, 4mL(IM,IV), individually packed in a box	NO BID								120.00	48,000.00
31		210	amp	Diclofenac 25mg/mL, 3mL amp(1M,IV)	F. Dick	29.00				14.50			21.00	4,410.00
38		100	amp	Ephedrine Sulfate 50mg/mL, 1mL	NO BID								150.00	15,000.00
41		25	vl	Hepatitis B Immunoglobulin (human) 0.5mL (IM)	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		Hepabig	2,300	2450.00	61,250.00
46		100	amp	Isoxsuprine Injection, 5mg/mL, 2mL (IM,IV)	NO BID					140.00			165.00	16,500.00
54		20	amp	Mecobalamin 500mcg/ml, 1mL amp, IM, IV, individually packed	NO BID								182.00	3,640.00
58		60	amp	Morphine Sulfate 10mg/mL, 1mL	NO BID								146.00	8,760.00
65		500	vl	Penicillin G Crystalline Sodium, 1 million units, Inj.	NO BID				NO BID				10.00	5,000.00
66		320	vl	Penicillin G Crystalline Sodium, 5 million units, Inj.	NO BID								18.00	5,760.00
67		40	amp	Phenobarbital 130mg/mL, 1mL	NO BID								1000.00	40,000.00
71		30	amp	Pyridoxine HCl 100mg/mL, 10mL (IM,IV)	NO BID								650.00	19,500.00
73		1,100	amp	Ranitidine HCl, 25mg/mL, 2mL(IM,IV), in glass ampule	NO BID					11.00			5.00	5,500.00
77		80	vl	Sodium bicarbonate 1meq/mL, 50mL(Adult) IV infusion	NO BID								250.00	20,000.00
82		15	amp	Verapamil HCl 2.5mg/mL, 2mL (IV)	NO BID								210.00	3,150.00
85		30	bot	Aciclovir 200 mg/5mL, 60mL	NO BID				NO BID				950.00	28,500.00
90		492	bot	Aluminum+Magnesium Hydroxide: 225mg/200mg/5mL, 120 mL	medalem	63.00	Generic 200mg/200mg/5ml	25.00					40.00	19,680.00
95		5,400	tab	Aspirin, 80mg coated	NO BID		Generic	0.75		1.00			1.50	8,100.00



PROVINCE OF BENGUET
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE (BeCH)
(DRUGS AND MEDICINES / MEDICAL SUPPLIES)



ABSTRACT OF PRICE QUOTATIONS - NEGOTIATED PROCUREMENT
(SMALL VALUE PROCUREMENT)

P.R. No.:

2022-01-0001

Quotation No.: SVP-2022-0046

MEGANO LTH PHARMA BLESSED ST. JOHN PHARM. MALUKA INT'L
 Dated: **March 3, 2022**

Opened on:

MARCH 9, 2022

Abstract No.:

REM CHIMED PHARM

P.R. No.	Item No.	Quantity	Unit	Description	Brand	Price	Remarks	Unit Price	Total Price	Abstract No.	Total Price
104	200	supp		Bisacodyl 5 mg, Pedia, Rectal	Laxanova	152.00	NO-BID		65.00		13,000.00
112	72	bot		Cefalexin Monohydrate 100mg/mL, powder for suspension, 10mL	NO BID		Generic	15.00	20.00		1,440.00
113	288	bot		Cefalexin Monohydrate 250mg/5mL, powder for suspension, 60mL	NO BID				28.00		8,064.00
116	5,300	cap		Cefixime 200mg	NO BID				8.00		42,400.00
118	230	bot		Cefuroxime Axetil 250mg/5mL, granules for suspension, 120mL, with flavor, no bitter taste, no after taste, alcohol free	NO BID		NO BID		240.00		55,200.00
122	230	bot		Cetirizine 2.5mg/mL, drops, 10mL	NO BID				24.00		5,520.00
124	200	tab		Chlorpheniramine maleate 4mg	NO BID				2.00		400.00
127	138	bot		Clarithromycin 125mg/5mL granules for suspension, 50mL, strawberry flavor	NO BID				195.00		26,910.00
132	72	bot		Cloxacillin Sodium 250mg/5mL, powder for suspension, 60mL	NO BID				33.00		2,376.00
137	36	bot		Cotrimoxazole 200mg/40mg/5ml susp, 70 mL	Kathrex	68.00	Generic	20.00	25.00		900.00
139	60	bot		Dicycloverine 10mg/5mL, 60 mL	NO BID		Generic	18.00	15.00		900.00
141	1,300	tab		Dydrogesterone 10mg	NO BID				82.00		106,600.00
143	20	bot		Erythromycin Ethyl Succinate 200mg/5mL, granules for susp. 60mL, with flavor, no bitter taste, no after taste, alcohol free	Monpharm	100.80	NO BID		165.00		3,300.00
146	24	bot		Ferrous salts solution 15mg Elemental iron /0.6 mL, 15 mL	NO BID				14.00		2,000.00
149	1,000	cap		Folic Acid 5mg	Prevera	2.70	Generic	1.25.00	2.00		2,000.00
154	1,000	tab		Glibenclamide 5 mg	NO BID		NO BID		0.80		1,000.00
155	140	tube		Hydrocortisone 1%, 10g ointment.	Chcert	1201.00	Generic	88.00	110.00		15,400.00
160	500	tab		Isosorbide mononitrate 60mg	NO BID		Generic	6.50	9.00		4,500.00
161	3,600	tab		Isosorbide mononitrate 30mg	Nitrofix	800.00	NO BID		13.00		14,600.00
163	74	tube		Ketoconazole cream/ointment 3.5 g to 5g	Fungitol	100.00	Generic	4.00	47.00		3,478.00
167	2,500	cap		Lansoprazole 30 mg	Apprevia	100.00			18.00		45,000.00
171	2,400	tab		Mecobalamin 500mcg	NO BID		NO BID		9.00		21,600.00
175	200	tab		Methylprednisolone 4mg	NO BID				9.00		1,800.00
179	108	bot		Multivitamins + Minerals drops, 15mL	NO BID		Generic	35.00	32.00		3,456.00
181	1,000	tab		Naproxen sodium 500 mg	Suprofen	11.90	Generic	6.00	5.00		5,000.00



PROVINCE OF BENGUET
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE (BeC)
(DRUGS AND MEDICINES / MEDICAL SUPPLIES)



ABSTRACT OF PRICE QUOTATIONS - NEGOTIATED PROCUREMENT
(SMALL VALUE PROCUREMENT)

P.R. No.: **2022-01-0001**

Quotation No.: **SVP-2022-0046**

MESANORTH PHARMA BLESSED STREET PHARM MALUYA INT'L
 Dated: **March 3, 2022**

REM CITIMED PHARMA
 Opened on: **MARCH 9, 2022**

Abstract No.:

182	72	bot	Neomycin+Polymixin B+ Fluocinolone Acetonide ear drops 3.5:mg+10,000 units+ 0.025%/mL, 5mL	NO BID		NO BID					230.00	16,560.00	
184	100	cap	Nifedipine 30mg	NO BID				NO BID			25.00	2,500.00	
187	3,000	sachet	Oral Rehydration Salt (ORS-75 R) / ,250mL, 25s	ORS	6.00	Dehydrosol	2.50	Dehydrosol	3.05	Dehydrosol	3.40	4.00	12,000.00
193	1,000	tab	Prednisone 10 mg	Presone	7.00				1.20			3.00	3,000.00
195	1,200	tab	Ranitidine 150 mg	Ranitine	7.50				1.90			1.00	1,200.00
199	72	bot	Salbutamol Sulfate 2mg/5ml, Syrup, 60mL	NO BID		Generic	13.50		12.00	NO BID		12.00	864.00
204	1500	tab	Tamsulosin 200mcg	Sultam	29.50	Generic	12.00		7.50			12.00	18,000.00
PHO													

Purpose: Drugs and Medicines for the use of 5 District Hospitals for CY 2022 (Revolving Fund).

982,752.00

Opening/Abstracting:

BAC Action/Recommendation:

[Signatures]
 BAC-TWG Member BAC-Secretariat Member

[Signature]
MARJORIE P. IGNACIO
 End-user Representative

[Signature]
NORA M. RUIZ, MD.
 Member

[Signature]
FIDELA A. LUIS
 Member

ABSENT
ANTONIO B. AMLAG
 Member

ABSENT
TOMASA S. ATAYOC
 Member

[Signature]
WILMA L. UBOS-LEE
 Member

[Signature]
MELIARAZON DULAY, MD.
 Vice Chairperson

[Signature]
ATTY. BRIAN J. CRISPIN
 Chairperson



PROVINCE OF BENGUET
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE (BeCH)
(DRUGS AND MEDICINES / MEDICAL SUPPLIES)



ABSTRACT OF PRICE QUOTATIONS - NEGOTIATED PROCUREMENT
(SMALL VALUE PROCUREMENT)

P.R. No.: **2022-01-0001**

Quotation No.: **SVP-2022-0046**

Dated: **March 3, 2022**

Opened on: **MARCH 9, 2022**

Abstract No.:

Item No.	Code	QTY	UNIT	DESCRIPTION/SPECIFICATION OF ARTICLES	STERITEX MEDICAL SYSTEM		MAGGOT PTARMA TRADING				ABC			
					Brand/Offer	Price	Brand/Offer	Price	Brand/Offer	Price	Brand/Offer	Price	Unit	Total
13		25	amp	Amiodarone HCl 50mg/ml, 3mL (150mg/3mL) (IV)	}							440.00	11,000.00	
14		30	amp	Amino Acids, Crystalline Standard, Inj. 9.12%, 20mL									270.00	8,100.00
19		1,400	amp	Anti-Tetanus Serum Equine (ATS) 1500 IU									70.00	98,000.00
20		160	amp	Atropine Sulfate 1mg/mL, 1ml, Inj.									12.00	1,920.00
22		500	amp	Bupivacaine HCl, Heavy, 0.5% X 4mL (spinal); hyperbaric, polyampule, in clear sterile single package with 8% dextrose		NO BID							120.00	60,000.00
24		10	amp	Carboprost 250mcg/ml									480.00	4,800.00
27		400	amp	Clindamycin Phosphate 150mg/mL, 4mL(IM,IV), individually packed in a box									120.00	48,000.00
31		210	amp	Diclofenac 25mg/mL, 3mL amp(1M,IV)									21.00	4,410.00
38		100	amp	Ephedrine Sulfate 50mg/mL, 1mL		HIZON	116.00		NO BID				150.00	15,000.00
41		25	vl	Hepatitis B Immunoglobulin (human) 0.5mL (IM)									2450.00	61,250.00
46		100	amp	Isoxsuprine Injection, 5mg/mL, 2mL (IM,IV)			NO BID						165.00	16,500.00
54		20	amp	Mecobalamin 500mcg/ml, 1mL amp, IM, IV, individually packed									182.00	3,640.00
58		60	amp	Morphine Sulfate 10mg/mL, 1mL		HIZON	106.00						146.00	8,760.00
65		500	vl	Penicillin G Crystalline Sodium, 1 million units, Inj.								10.00	5,000.00	
66		320	vl	Penicillin G Crystalline Sodium, 5 million units, Inj.								18.00	5,760.00	
67		40	amp	Phenobarbital 130mg/mL, 1mL								1000.00	40,000.00	
71		30	amp	Pyridoxine HCl 100mg/mL, 10mL (IM,IV)		NO BID						650.00	19,500.00	
73		1,100	amp	Ranitidine HCl, 25mg/mL, 2mL(IM,IV), in glass ampule								5.00	5,500.00	
77		80	vl	Sodium bicarbonate 1meq/mL, 50mL(Adult) IV infusion								250.00	20,000.00	
82		15	amp	Verapamil HCl 2.5mg/mL, 2mL (IV)								210.00	3,150.00	
85		30	bot	Aciclovir 200 mg/5mL, 60mL								950.00	28,500.00	
90		492	bot	Aluminum+Magnesium Hydroxide:225mg/200mg/5mL, 120 mL	Melmag	29.00	Medalem	32.00				40.00	19,680.00	
95		5,400	tab	Aspirin, 80mg coated	Phleprin	.86	Scheprin	.78				1.50	8,100.00	



**PROVINCE OF BENGUET
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE (DeCH)
(DRUGS AND MEDICINES / MEDICAL SUPPLIES)**



**ABSTRACT OF PRICE QUOTATIONS - NEGOTIATED PROCUREMENT
(SMALL VALUE PROCUREMENT)**

P.R. No.:	2022-01-0001	Quotation No.:	SVP-2022-0046	Dated:	SYSTEM March 3, 2022	MACCOT PHARMA TRADING	Opened on:	MARCH 9, 2022	Abstract No.:		
104	200	supp	Bisacodyl 5 mg, Pedia, Rectal		NO BID				65.00	13,000.00	
112	72	bot	Cefalexin Monohydrate 100mg/mL, powder for suspension, 10mL	Diacef	17-00	Exel		19	20.00	1,440.00	
113	288	bot	Cefalexin Monohydrate 250mg/5mL, powder for suspension, 60mL	}		Exel		26.9	28.00	8,064.00	
116	5,300	cap	Cefixime 200mg						8.00	42,400.00	
118	230	bot	Cefuroxime Axetil 250mg/5mL, granules for suspension, 120mL, with flavor, no bitter taste, no after taste, alcohol free			NO BID	Sqcef		138	240.00	55,200.00
122	230	bot	Cetirizine 2.5mg/mL, drops, 10mL				Atlecure 15ml		24	24.00	5,520.00
124	200	tab	Chlorpheniramine maleate 4mg						2.00	400.00	
127	138	bot	Clarithromycin 125mg/5mL granules for suspension, 50mL, strawberry flavor						195.00	26,910.00	
132	72	bot	Cloxacillin Sodium 250mg/5mL, powder for suspension, 60mL						33.00	2,376.00	
137	36	bot	Cotrimoxazole 200mg/40mg/5ml susp, 70 mL						25.00	900.00	
139	60	bot	Dicycloverine 10mg/5mL, 60 mL		NO BID				15.00	900.00	
141	1,300	tab	Dydrogesterone 10mg						82.00	106,600.00	
143	20	bot	Erythromycin Ethyl Succinate 200mg/5mL, granules for susp. 60mL, with flavor, no bitter taste, no after taste, alcohol free	Monphevin	61-00				165.00	3,300.00	
146	24	bot	Ferrous salts solution 15mg Elemental iron /0.6 mL, 15 mL		NO BID				2.00	2,000.00	
149	1,000	cap	Folic Acid 5mg	Koksaph	1-20				2.00	2,000.00	
154	1,000	tab	Glibenclamide 5 mg						1.00	1,000.00	
155	140	tube	Hydrocortisone 1%, 10g ointment.		NO BID				110.00	15,400.00	
160	500	tab	Isosorbide mononitrate 60mg			NITROFIX		7.28	9.00	4,500.00	
161	3,600	tab	Isosorbide mononitrate 30mg	ISMODIN	10-60	NITROFIX		7.98	13.00	14,600.00	
163	74	tube	Ketoconazole cream/ointment 3.5 g to 5g						47.00	3,478.00	
167	2,500	cap	Lansoprazole 30 mg						18.00	45,000.00	
171	2,400	tab	Mecobalamin 500mcg		NO BID				9.00	21,600.00	
175	200	tab	Methylprednisolone 4mg						9.00	1,800.00	
179	108	bot	Multivitamins + Minerals drops, 15mL						32.00	3,456.00	
181	1,000	tab	Naproxen sodium 500 mg						5.00	5,000.00	



**PROVINCE OF BENGUET
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE (BeGH)
(DRUGS AND MEDICINES / MEDICAL SUPPLIES)**



**ABSTRACT OF PRICE QUOTATIONS - NEGOTIATED PROCUREMENT
(SMALL VALUE PROCUREMENT)**

P.R. No.: **2022-01-0001**

Quotation No.: **SVP-2022-0046**

Dated: **March 3, 2022**

Opened on: **MARCH 9, 2022**

Abstract No.: **0063**

P.R. No.	Quantity	Unit	Description	Brand/Supplier	Unit Price	Total Price	Remarks	
182	72	bot	Neomycin+Polymixin B+ Fluocinclone Acetonide ear drops 3.5:mg+10,000 units+ 0.025%/mL, 5mL		NO BID	230.00	16,560.00	
184	100	cap	Nifedipine 30mg		NO BID	25.00	2,500.00	
187	3,000	sachet	Oral Rehydration Salt (ORS-75 R) / ,250mL, 25s	Dehydrasol	2.85	4.00	12,000.00	
193	1,000	tab	Prednisone 10 mg	Vonweit	14.50	3.00	3,000.00	
195	1,200	tab	Ranitidine 150 mg	1	NO BID	1.00	1,200.00	
199	72	bot	Salbutamol Sulfate 2mg/5ml,Syrup, 60mL	Nabufol	15.00	12.00	864.00	
204	1500	tab	Tamsulosin 200mcg	Sultam	8.48	12.00	18,000.00	
PHO								
Purpose: Drugs and Medicines for the use of 5 District Hospitals for CY 2022 (Revolving Fund).							982,752.00	

Opening/Abstracting:

NARREN JAKE DUCAYAG
BAC-TWG Member

LANNIE A. BANTAS
BAC-Secretariat Member

BAC Action/Recommendation:

FOR FURTHER EVALUATION

MARJORIE P. IGNACIO
End-user Representative

NORA M. RUIZ, MD
Member

FIDELA A. LUIS
Member

ANTONIO B. AMLAG
Member

TOMASA S. ATAYOC
Member

WILMA L. UBOS-LEE
Member

MELIARAZON DULAY, MD.
Vice Chairperson

ATTY. BRIAN J. CRISPIN
Chairperson