

ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS CALCULATED (Small Value Procurement)

Original Copy
attached to
2021-12-1272

Project Name: PROCUREMENT OF MEDICAL, DENTAL AND LABORATORY SUPPLIES FOR NORTHERN BENGUET DISTRICT HOSPITAL

Abstract No.: 2021-45

Approved Budget for the Contract: Php 728,550.00

Time: 1:30 PM

Venue: BAC-BeGH, 1st flr, BeGH Bldg., BeGH Cmpd., Km. 5, La Trinidad, Benguet

The Bids opened on: July 7, 2021

Quotation No.: NP-SVP-2021-32

Project Reference Number: B-PHO-2021-03-009 /PR No. 21-02-0417

Item No.	QTY	Unit of Issue	DESCRIPTION/SPECIFICATION OF ARTICLES	ABC		BLESSED ST. JOHN PHARMACEUTICALS AND GENERAL MERCHANDISE		MONES DENTAL LABORATORY		NORTHEAST MEDICAL TRADING		MALYKA INTERNATIONAL TRADING CORP.	
				Unit Price	Total Amount	Brand Name/Remarks	Unit Price	Total Amount	Brand Name/Remarks	Unit Price	Total Amount	Brand Name/Remarks	Unit Price
1	2	bot	Applicator stick, Micro tip, sterile, 100's/bot, dental	300.00	600.00		NO BID	275	550	290	580	200	400
2	3	syringe	37% phosphoric Acid Etching Gel, 30ml	450.00	1350.00		NO BID	400	1200	196	588	250	750
3	3	bot	Bonding Agent, Single Bond Universal Adhesive, 5ml	3,600.00	10800.00	1300	3900	393.33	1180	10.00	1950	1000	3000
4	3	pc	Burs, Diamond Round, 2FG	80.00	240.00	70	210	73.33	220			60	180
5	3	pc	Burs, Diamond Round, 2RA	80.00	240.00	70	210	73.33	220			60	180
6	3	pc	Burs, Diamond Round, 3FG	80.00	240.00	70	210	73.33	220			60	180
7	3	pc	Burs, Diamond Round, 4FG	80.00	240.00	70	210	73.33	220			60	180
8	2	pc	Burs, Diamond, inverted 34RA	80.00	160.00	70	140	75.00	150			60	120
9	2	pc	Burs, Diamond, inverted 36FG	80.00	160.00	70	140	75	150		NO BID	60	120
10	2	pc	Burs, Diamond, inverted 37FG	80.00	160.00	70	140	75	150			60	120
11	2	pc	Burs, Diamond, inverted 38 RA	80.00	160.00	70	140	75	150			60	120
	2	pc	Burs, Diamond, Straight, 556FG	80.00	160.00	70	140	75	150			60	120
	2	pc	Burs, Diamond, Straight, 558fg	80.00	160.00	70	140	75	150			60	120
14	2	box	Calcium Hydroxide (DYCAL), 13grams	2,000.00	4000.00	1600	3200	1900	3800			1850	3700
21	5	box	Dental needle, extrashort, G30, 100's/pedia)	450.00	2250.00	340	1700	420	2100			380	1900
22	2	tube	Fluoride varnish, 50mg/pack (duraphant)	2,000.00	4000.00		NO BID	1700	3400	2025	6050	2000	4000
23	3	pack	polybib, disposable, 100's	250.00	750.00	220	660	216.66	650	350	1050	230	690
24	2	tube	Self-cured temporary filling material, 28g paste	700.00	1400.00			600	1200		NO BID		NO BID
25	1	bot	Acetone, 1 liter	450.00	450.00			400	400		NO BID		NO BID
26	1	bot	Acid, Acetic 3%, 1 liter	300.00	300.00		NO BID	250	250	278	278		
53	15	box	Blood Lancet, Twist top, G21, Sterile, 200's/box (Needle gauge	450.00	6750.00			433.33	6500	450	6750	450	6750
57	2	bot	Drabskin Reagent, 500ml	180.00	360.00			170	340	240	560		
86	2	vial	Rapid antibody Medium Liss additive, 10ml	300.00	600.00			275	550	793	1586		NO BID
87	4	box	Salmonella Test for IgM w/ magnetic colorscale (winning bidder to	15,000.00	60000.00			14500	58000	15000	60000		
	3	pc	Test tube holder, stainless	30.00	90.00	30	90	2766	83		NO BID		

BLESSED ST. JOHN

MONES

NORTHEAST

MALYKA

91	2	pack	Test Tubes, 13mm x 75mm, glass, 50's/pack	250.00	500.00			225	450	199	398			NO BID		
97	50	tube	Urine strips, 10 parameters, 100 strips/tube (Highly visible color)	450.00	22500.00			440	22000	545	27250					
101	1	pack	Vacuum tubes, Sodium citrate additive, Black Cap ,3ml, 100's/pack	1,000.00	1000.00			800	800	680	680			680	680	
114	5	box	Catheter Foley, 2-way F-14, 10's/box	250.00	1250.00		350	1750	240	1200	340	1700			250	1250
115	5	box	Catheter, Foley, 2-way, F-16 10's/box	250.00	1250.00		350	1750	240	1200	340	1700			250	1250
116	5	box	Catheter, Foley, 2-way, F-18 10's/box	250.00	1250.00		350	1750	240	1200	340	1700			250	1250
117	20	pc	Catheter, Straight, Unsterile, Red Rubber, Fr.10	7.00	140.00		28	560	650	1300						
118	10	pc	Catheter, Straight, Unsterile, Red Rubber, Fr.12	7.00	70.00		28	280	6	60						
129	15	box	Gloves, examination, Latex, Powder free, unsterile, small,	140.00	2100.00		450	6750	133-33	2000	560	8400				
130	15	box	Gloves, examination, Latex, Powder free, unsterile, medium,	140.00	2100.00		450	6750	133-33	2000	560	8400				
131	15	box	Gloves, examination, Latex, Powder free, unsterile, large,	140.00	2100.00		450	6750	133-33	2000	560	8400				
132	200	box	Gloves, Surgical, Sterile, Disposable, Natural Rubber latex, powder	600.00	120000.00		850	170000	552-50	110500	855	171000				
133	200	box	Gloves, Surgical, Sterile, Disposable, Natural Rubber latex, powder	600.00	120000.00		850	170000	552-50	110500	855	171000				
134	150	box	Gloves, Surgical, Sterile, Disposable, Natural Rubber latex, powder	600.00	90000.00		850	127500	566-66	85000	855	128250				
135	10	pc	Halogen display/optic lamp HLX64640 150W.24V G6.35	600.00	6000.00				550	5500					6000	6000
151	200	pc	Nebulizer tube with mask neonate	40.00	8000.00				35	7000						
155	1	box	Needle, hypodermic, disposable, G26 x 1", 100's/box	120.00	120.00				110	110	116	116				
159	50	pc	Oxygen mask, neonate	50.00	2500.00				48	2400	48	2400				
166	50	pack	Recording paper, CTG Fetal monitor pape, Corometrics 152 x	1,600.00	80000.00				1500	75000	775	38750				
168	30	pack	Shoe Cover for OR, disposable, large, 50's/pack	125.00	3750.00		200	6000	116-66	3500	310	9300				
173	12	box	Suture, Chromic, 70cm length, 1/2C needle, Reverse Cutting, 2/0,	4,000.00	48000.00		350	4200	3916-66	47000	648	77016				
174	5	pc	Suture, Chromic, 70cm length, 1/2C needle, Reverse Cutting, 3/0,	1,200.00	6000.00		350	1750	1200	6000	500	2500				
180	150	box	Syringe with needle, disposable, 10cc, 100's/box	230.00	34500.00		450	67500	226-66	34000	430	64500				
181	5	box	Tongue depressor, Sterile, Individually wrapped, 100's/box	100.00	500.00		150	750	85	400	115	575				
193	6	pc	Dental Composite nonstick filling instrument kit(flat plastic, spatula	10,000.00	60000.00				9166	55000					7000	42000
194	5	pc	hand instrument, explorer	300.00	1500.00		200	1000	280	1400					250	1250
195	5	pc	hand instrument, spoon excavator	300.00	1500.00		200	1000	280	1400					250	1250
196	5	pc	hand instrument, cotton plier non-locking	300.00	1500.00		200	1000	280	1400					250	1250
197	5	pc	Round/Ball burnisher (hand instrument)	300.00	1500.00		200	1000	280	1400					250	1250
198	5	pc	Hand instrument Acorn Burnisher	300.00	1500.00		200	1000	280	1400					250	1250
199	10	pc	Kelly Pad	500.00	5000.00		850	8500	400	4000	702	7020				
202	1	pc	Non-stick composite spatula-Hand instrument	300.00	300.00		380	380	250	250					300	300
206	5	pc	Surgical, Gum separator(dental)	500.00	2500.00				480	2400	400	2000			450	2250
207	2	pc	Surgical Luxating Root elevator 3mm straight	1,000.00	2000.00		800	1600	900	1800					900	1800
208	2	pc	Surgical Luxating Root elevator 4mm straight	1,000.00	2000.00		800	1600	900	1800					900	1800
				*****NBDH*****	Total	728,550.00										

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Original Copy

attached to

2021-12-1272








NORBERTA BONA-70

Opening/ Abstracting :

REMARKS/ BAC ACTION:


JOSEPH GIOVANNI C. FRIAS
BAC-TWG-Vice-Chairperson


FLORA M. GUIOD
BAC Secretariat

Recommended award item nos. 1,2,3,4,5,6,7,8,9,10,11,12,13,22,101,135,193 & 202 to Malyka International Trading						
14,23,90,168,194,195,196,197,198,207,& 208 to Blessed Saint John						
26,53,57,86,87,91,97,155,159,166,173,180,181,199 & 206 to Northeast Medical Trading						
Item Nos. 129,130,131,132,133,134- failed due to above ABC						
24,25 & 151- failed due to no bid and business permit is limited to dental laboratory only and not a distributor of dental and medical supplies						
21,114,115,116,117,118 & 174- failed due to no CPR and business permit is limited to dental laboratory only and not a distributor of dental and medical supplies						
All failed items to return to end user for their appropriate action						
 ATTY. BRIAN J. CRISPIN Member	 JENNETTE MARIE G. BANGAO Member	 MIRIAM V. TIENGAN Member	 TOMASA S. ATAYOC Member	 WILMA L. LEE Member	 NORA M. RUIZ Chairperson	
 MELIARAZON F. DULAY Vice- Chairperson	<i>Absent</i> OSCAR G. PARIS Philippine Red Cross, Observer	<i>Absent</i> VICENTE PANAGAN, JR. PNA President- Benguet Chapter, Observer	<i>Absent</i>	<i>Absent</i> MARCELITA D. CAWILAN COA- Benguet, Observer		

Original Copy
attached to
2021-12-1272


NOREL MITO